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Itinerary Details
 
 

Historic Rajasthan
 

8Nights 9Days
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Day 1 : JAIPUR
 

On arrival in Jaipur today, you will be met and transferred to your hotel.The capital of Rajasthan Jaipur -
popularly known as the ‘Pink City’ as Pink sandstone was used to construct the buildings in the Old walled city.
The remainder of your day is at leisure. Overnight stay at your hotel in Jaipur. 

Hotel Category

Cost Saver               : Hawa Mahal 

Classic                       : Red Fox

Deluxe                       : Mansingh

Breakfast  
 

Day 2 : SIGHTSEEING OF JAIPUR
 

After breakfast proceed on full day city tour of Jaipur – visiting Amer Fort which used to be the capital, till it was
moved to Jaipur. The fort is built with white marble and red sandstone and looks even more attractive because of
the Maota Lake in the foreground. Ascend the fort on elephant back (own cost) or by jeep. Later visit the City of
Jaipur. Among the highlights to be seen while touring Jaipur include the City Palace, the Jantar Mantar and the
famous Hawa Mahal. Overnight at your hotel in Jaipur. 

Hotel Category

Cost Saver               : Hawa Mahal 

Classic                       : Red Fox

Deluxe                       : Mansingh

Breakfast  
 

Day 3 : JAIPUR TO RANTHAMBORE
 

After breakfast drive to Ranthambore; The Ranthambore National Park is one of the finest tiger reserves in India
where more visitors spending a couple of nights are likely to spot the majestic tigers. Apart from tiger you can
see herds of Chital and Sambar deer, hordes of wild boar, Nilgai antelope and Chinkara There are also water
birds like storks, ducks and geese at the lakes and waterholes.Afternoon Game Drive (Own cost) to
Ranthambore National Park. Overnight at your hotel in Ranthambore. 
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Hotel Category

Cost Saver               : Raja Palace 

Classic                       : Tiger Machan

Deluxe                       : Rathambore Regency

Breakfast  
 

Day 4 : RANTHAMBORE – UDAIPUR
 

Early morning Game Drive [Own Cost] into the Park where your naturalist will talk to you about the wildlife found
in this Park. Later drive to Udaipur visiting Chittorgarh en-route. Chittorgarh, is said to have been originally built
by Bhim, one of the Pandavas. Though deserted now, impressive reminders of its grandeur still stand. Overnight
at your hotel in Udaipur. 

Hotel Category

Cost Saver               : Rajwada Palace 

Classic                       : Lords Inn

Deluxe                       : Fern Residency

Breakfast  
 

Day 5 : UDAIPUR
 

After breakfast proceed on a half day city tour of Udaipur – visiting the City Palace and Museum. The largest
palace complex in India, it is a blend of Mughal and Rajput influences. Also see the 17th century Jagdish temple,
drive around the Fatehsagar Lake, and visit the Sahelion ki Bari an ornamental pleasure garden with fountains
and marble kiosks. Later in the evening take a boat ride on Lake Pichola, which is fringed with hills, palaces,
havelis, ghats, embankments and temples and offers spectacular views of the city. Overnight at your hotel in
Udaipur. 

Hotel Category

Cost Saver               : Rajwada Palace 

Classic                       : Lords Inn

Deluxe                       : Fern Residency

Breakfast  
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Day 6 : UDAIPUR - JODHPUR
 

After breakfast, proceed to Jodhpur visiting Ranakpur en-route. Ranakpur is the largest Jain temple complex in
India and dates to the 15th century. There are 1444 ornately carved marble pillars in the complex and none of
them are similar.Continue your drive to Jodhpur. Overnight at your hotel in Jodhpur. 

Hotel Category

Cost Saver               : Priya 

Classic                       : Heritage Inn

Deluxe                       : Rang Mahal

Breakfast  
 

Day 7 : JODHPUR - JAISALMER
 

After breakfast proceed for a city tour of Jodhpur visit the spectacular Meherangarh Fort, and the imposing
Jaswant Thada. Continue your tour with a visit to Sardar Bazaar and the Clock Tower Market. Later drive to
Jaisalmer- a fairy-tale town in the Thar Desert founded about 800 years ago. Overnight at your hotel in
Jaisalmer. 

Hotel Category

Cost Saver               : Priya 

Classic                       : Heritage Inn

Deluxe                       : Rang Mahal

Breakfast  
 

Day 8 : JAISALMER
 

After breakfast proceed on a sightseeing tour of Jaisalmer. Visit the famous Havelis known for their frescoes.
Then continue to the impressive fort which stands atop the 80 m high Trikuta hill. In the evening, proceed on an
excursion to Sam Sand dunes which provide you with an unforgettable experience of camel rides and the sunset
over the desert. Overnight at your hotel in Jaisalmer. 

Hotel Category

Cost Saver               : Royal Inn
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Classic                       : Rajdarshan

Deluxe                       : Valley View

Breakfast  
 

Day 9 : JAISALMER – JODHPUR
 

After breakfast this morning, you will check out of your hotel and be transferred to Jodhpur airport for your
onward journey.

Breakfast  
 
 
 

Highlights
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